

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 196

09/30/09	TEL. CONF. WITH BRYAN WHITNEY RE STOCK SALE -- VOYAGER ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
09/30/09	TEL. CONF. WITH BRIAN WHITNEY WITH UBS RE STOCK ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
10/19/09	TEL. CONF. WITH BRIAN WHITNEY RE VOYAGER STOCK; PREPARE MEMO TO K.B. PHELPS, REVIEW RESPONSE, REPLY ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
02/22/10	REVIEW AUDIT REQUEST FROM DE JOYA, GRIFFITH & COMPANY, LLC, VOYAGER AUDITORS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 59		.90	311.50
LITIGATION - 6			
08/06/09	REVIEW PROPOSAL FROM ALL NEW MATERIALS; PREPARE MEMO TO K.B. PHELPS RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.80	380.00
08/06/09	REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSE RE ALL NEW MATERIALS NEGOTIATION ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/06/09	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE ALL NEW MATERIALS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/06/09	REVIEW HAMILTON RESPONSE RE SETTLEMENT; CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.80	380.00
09/30/09	REVIEW OFFER FROM RYAN HAMILTON; PREPARE MEMO TO K.B. PHELPS RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 197

10/14/09	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE ENFORCEMENT PROVISIONS IN ALL NEW MATERIALS AGREEMENT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
11/03/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE PROPOSED DEAL IN ALL NEW MATERIALS, RESPOND RE ACCEPTABLE TERMS; REVIEW MEMO FROM ANM COUNSEL RE NEW TERMS; APPROVE ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.50	237.50
11/04/09	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE ALL NEW MATERIALS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/23/09	REVIEW PROPOSAL RE PURCHASE RE ANM; RESPOND ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
11/23/09	REVIEW REPORT RE ANM RENEGING ON DEAL; REPLY WITH INSTRUCTIONS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
12/07/09	REVIEW NEW OFFER RE ALL NEW MATERIALS; MEMO TO K.B. PHELPS RE LEGAL ISSUES ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
01/07/10	REVIEW K.B. PHELPS MEMO RE OFFER BY HAMILTON; PREPARE MEMO TO ZAKIM RE PROPERTY VALUES (127 MOUNTAIN) AND REVIEW RESPONSE; REVIEW 127 UPPER MOUNTAIN LEASE; CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	1.20	570.00
02/04/10	REVIEW ALL NEW MATERIALS' DISSOLUTION AND DISCOVERY MATERIALS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010 PAGE 198

SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 6	5.40	2565.00
LITIGATION - 60		
08/05/09 REVIEW AND EXECUTE DECLARATION RE MEHLMAN REQUEST FOR ATTACHMENT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/06/09 PREPARE DISBURSEMENT AUTHORIZATION RE FILING FEE FOR COMPLAINT RE KEVIN T. MEHLMAN ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
08/14/09 SIGN BOND APP RE MEHLMAN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/26/09 PREPARE DISBURSEMENT AUTHORIZATION RE WRIT OF ATTACHMENT ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
08/27/09 REVIEW REPORT FROM GILBERT G. MIKALIAN RE LEVY ON MEHLMAN ASSETS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
09/01/09 PREPARE DISBURSEMENT AUTHORIZATION RE BOND PREMIUM ON T.P.O./WRIT OF ATTACHMENT BOND ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
09/17/09 REVIEW MEMO FROM G.G. MIKALIAN RE REISSUING CHECK TO U.S. MARSHALL RE KEVIN MEHLMAN; PREPARE REQUEST TO STOP PAYMENT ON CHECK NUMBER 1220 AND ISSUE NEW CHECK TO U.S. MARSHALL SERVICE ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.20	37.00
09/22/09 TEL. CONF. WITH LISA OF US MARSHALL RE REPLACEMENT CHECK; ARRANGE FOR SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 199

11/20/09	PREPARE DISBURSEMENT AUTHORIZATION RE COSTS FOR DOCUMENTS RE SUBPOENA KEVIN MEHLMAN ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
	SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 60	1.30	443.50
	LITIGATION - 62		
09/01/09	REVIEW EDGEMERE APPRAISAL ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
09/13/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE EDGEMERE; RESPOND (RE OFFER) ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
09/14/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE N.Y. COUNSEL RE N.Y. LLC, RESPOND ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
09/16/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM IN RE PERSONAL PROPERTY AND LEGAL ISSUES; REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE SAME. EDGEMERE ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
09/16/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM ZAKIM RE SALES PROCEDURES ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
09/16/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE EDGEMERE ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
09/21/09	REVIEW MEMOS FROM K.B. PHELPS AND JACK ZAKIM RE VALUE OF AND SALE OF BOAT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
09/30/09	REVIEW PROPOSED CONTRACT RE EDGEMERE; REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE SAME; PREPARE MEMO TO K.B. PHELPS AND JACK ZAKIM ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 200

10/02/09	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE COSTS AT NEW YORK PROPERTY ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
10/15/09	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT AGREEMENT RE N.Y. PROPERTY; CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.50	237.50
10/21/09	REVIEW AND SIGN EDGEMERE TRANSACTION DOCUMENTS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
10/21/09	EDGEMERE- REVIEW DOCS, EXECUTE AGREEMENT; CONFERENCE WITH G.G. MIKALIAN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
11/03/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM EDGEMERE DOCUMENTATION; PREPARE MEMO TO K.B. PHELPS RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
11/09/09	REVIEW AND EXECUTE NOTICE OF MOTION AND MOTION TO APPROVE AGREEMENT TO ASSIGN (SELL) MEMBERSHIP UNITS IN 55 EDGEMERE AVE AND FOR AUTHORITY TO SELL INTEREST FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS, CLAIMS, AND ENCUMBRANCES; DECLARATION ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
12/15/09	REVIEW, APPROVE AND EXECUTE BILL OF SALE AGREEMENT RE 55 EDGEMERE AVENUE, LLC ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
12/16/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM ZAKIM RE CLOSING OF SALE ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
12/21/09	REVIEW AND REVISE FORM 1 RE SALE OF 55 EDGEMERE ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
12/21/09	PREPARE RECEIPT RE WIRE TRANSFER RE SALE PROCEED RE 55 EDGEMERE ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 201

01/25/10 TEL. CONF. WITH ROGER PELLEGRINI RE TAX ID NUMBER ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	19.50
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 62	4.30	1956.50
LITIGATION - 63		
08/24/09 REVIEW MEMO FROM C. LIMON RE CANCUN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/28/09 REPORT OF C. LIMON RE CANCUN; PREPARE MEMO TO K.B. PHELPS RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
09/25/09 REVIEW LAWYER OPINION ON CANCUN PROPERTY. ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
09/30/09 REVIEW, APPROVE AND SIGN RETAINER AGREEMENT -- LIMON ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
10/16/09 REVIEW AND APPROVE APPLICATION TO EMPLOY BRYAN GONZALES ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/18/09 CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE MEXICAN ASSETS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
01/15/10 REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE PROPOSAL TO RESOLVE LIQUIDATION OF CANCUN CONDO; REPLY; REVIEW COPY OF HER TRANSMITTAL TO LIMON ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
01/15/10 REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE PROPOSAL FROM APPEL TO SETTLE CANCUN ISSUE; RESPOND ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010 PAGE 202

01/29/10 RESEARCH RE IMPROVEMENTS TO CANCUN CONDOMINIUM ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.50	237.50
02/12/10 REVIEW COUNSEL'S MONTHLY BILLING STATEMENT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 63	2.10	997.50
LITIGATION - 64		
11/04/09 CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE BELLA VILLAGIO OFFER ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 64	.20	95.00
LITIGATION - 65		
12/03/09 REVIEW AND EXECUTE DECLARATION RE SHAWNA FRIEDMAN WRIT OF ATTACHMENT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
12/23/09 PREPARE DISBURSEMENT AUTHORIZATION RE WRIT OF ATTACHMENT RE SHAWNA FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 65	.30	113.50
LITIGATION - 66		
10/15/09 REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE INSIDER STATUS OF SITOMARS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
12/02/09 REVIEW AND EXECUTE DECLARATION RE ROBERT & JULIE SITOMER WRIT OF ATTACHMENT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 203

12/23/09	PREPARE DISBURSEMENT AUTHORIZATION RE WRIT OF ATTACHMENT RE ROBERT & JULIE SITOMER ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
12/29/09	REVIEW MEMO RE DEVELOPMENTS VS SITOMER AND OTHER CLAIMS; CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE SAME AND COMPLAINTS OF COUNSEL FOR SITOMER ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
02/18/10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM GILBERT G. MIKALIAN TO J. PHILLIPS RE SITOMER TRANSFERS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
	SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 66	.90	398.50
	LITIGATION - 67		
08/20/09	ACCEPT SERVICE, REVIEW AND CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE LAWSUIT IVIE V. DLG AND JACKSON ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.50	237.50
08/26/09	READ PLEADINGS RE AND REVIEW MEMO FROM G.E. SCHULMAN RE IVIE SUIT IN MICHIGAN RE REFUSAL OF PLAINTIFF TO DISMISS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.40	190.00
09/30/09	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COUNSEL TO H. BELL REGARDING MICHIGAN ACTION ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.10	47.50
10/05/09	REVIEW PLEADINGS IN IVIE CONTEMPT MOTION ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.50	237.50
10/05/09	REVIEW PLEADINGS RE OSC RE CONTEMPT--IVIE ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.40	190.00
10/07/09	REVIEW OSC RE IVIE CITATION ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 204

10/07/09	FIRST DRAFT MEMO TO WEBSITE RE IVIE MATTER ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 67		2.30	1092.50
LITIGATION - 68			
02/02/10	TEL. CONF. WITH K.B. PHELPS RE CUTOFF DEMAND TO INVESTORS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
02/03/10	REVIEW FINAL DRAFT LETTER TO NET WINNER GROUP; REVISE; PREPARE MEMO TO COUNSEL ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
02/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH CALLAGHAN RE NET WINNER CHART; DRAFT NET WINNER LETTER REVISIONS, CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN; CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS; CONFERENCE WITH BOTH COUNSEL RE STRATEGY; REVIEW REVISED LETTER. ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	1.50	712.50
02/23/10	REVIEW AND REVISE NET WINNER COMPLAINT; CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.60	285.00
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 68		2.50	1187.50
LITIGATION - 69			
02/09/10	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS AND G.E. SCHULMAN RE KIRKLAND AND ELLIS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.50	237.50
02/23/10	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS AND G.E. SCHULMAN RE STRATEGY ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.40	190.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 205

SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 69	.90	427.50
LITIGATION - 7		
08/14/09 REVIEW OPERATING REPORT FOR LEGEND OAKS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/26/09 RESEARCH RE ALLEGATIONS OF FRIEDMAN THAT LEGEND OAKS DEFAULT HAD BEEN CURED ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.40	190.00
09/15/09 REVIEW LEGEND OAKS MONTHLY STATEMENT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
10/15/09 REVIEW LEGEND OAKS REPORT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 7	1.00	475.00
LITIGATION - 70		
11/03/09 REVIEW REPORT RE INVESTIGATION INTO LENDERS DEPOT; CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
12/09/09 PREPARE DISBURSEMENT AUTHORIZATION RE COPIES OF DEEDS FOR FIVE YOUNGSTOWN PROPERTIES ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 70	.40	161.00
LITIGATION - 71		
02/23/10 CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE PROPOSED MEETING WITH MAYER; CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE CANCELLATION ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 206

SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 71	.20	95.00
LITIGATION - 73		
02/18/10 REVIEW MEMOS FROM K.B. PHELPS AND G.G. MIKALIAN RE WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS AND GARY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
02/26/10 PREPARE MEMO TO RACHEL LAYBOURN RE DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 73	.20	39.00
LITIGATION - 8		
08/04/09 TEL. CONF. WITH WALTER HAHN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/04/09 CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE REPORTS PREPARED BY W. HAHN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/06/09 REVIEW SUPPLEMENTALS RE BROWN FIELD; CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.50	237.50
08/06/09 CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE BROWN FIELD ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/06/09 CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE BROWN FIELD ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/11/09 TEL. CONF. WITH WALTER HAHN RE REPORT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
08/24/09 TEL. CONF. WITH W. HAHN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 207

09/10/09	REVIEW BROWN FIELD AGREEMENT; CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.80	380.00
09/11/09	BROWN FIELD MOTION; CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN AND GILBERT G. MIKALIAN RE MOTION, REVIEW REVISIONS, APPROVE ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	1.00	475.00
09/11/09	CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE BROWN FIELD ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
10/02/09	REVIEW MOTION DOCUMENTS; CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS ABOUT HEARING 10/05 RE BROWN FIELD TRANSACTION ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.70	332.50
10/05/09	REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE HEARING; PREPARE MEMO TO G.E. SCHULMAN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/02/09	REVIEW AND EXECUTE AGREEMENT RE BROWN FIELD; PREPARE MEMO TO ACCOUNTANTS RE REVISIONS TO BOOKS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/06/09	RICHARD SAX RE PAYMENT; CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/09/09	REVIEW BROWN FIELD FINANCIALS; PREPARE MEMO TO CALLAGAHAN ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.40	190.00
11/12/09	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM SAX WITH FIRST PAYMENT; PREPARE MEMO TO C.A. BLAIR RE MONITORING INVESTMENT ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010

PAGE 208

11/12/09	PREPARE CHECK RECEIPT RE DISTRIBUTION RE BROWN FIELD INTERNATIONAL BUSINESS PARK; REVISE FORM 1 RE RECEIPT ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
11/14/09	11-10-09 -- REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. SAX RE CLOSING AND FUNDING OF TRANSACTION ALONG WITH CHECK; REVIEW RESPONSE FROM G.E. SCHULMAN RE SAME; FORWARD FOR HANDLING ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/18/09	TEL. CONF. WITH M.L. ROBERTSON RE \$18,029 CHECK RECEIVED AND DEPOSITED 11/12/09 FROM DISTINCTIVE PROJECTS CO., INC. FOR PAYMENT RE BROWN FIELD INTERNATIONAL BUSINESS PARK LLC RETURNED BY BANK; PREPARE MEMO TO D.A. GILL, K.B. PHELPS AND G.E. SCHULMAN RE SAME ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.20	37.00
11/19/09	FOLLOW UP ON NSF CHECK FROM SAX ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/20/09	TEL. CONF. WITH SHANNON TAGGART RE NSF CHECK AND REDEPOSITING CHECK ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
11/20/09	PREPARE MEMO TO D.A. GILL AND G.E. SCHULMAN RE NSF CHECK AND REDEPOSITING CHECK ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.10	18.50
02/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH REBECCA AND LORI RE W9 FOR SETTLEMENT RE BROWNFIELD INTERNATIONAL; PREPARE W9 AND FORWARD AS REQUESTED ASSISTANT: CHERYL A. BLAIR	.20	39.00
02/27/10	REVIEW MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT; PREPARE MEMO TO CALLAGHAN RE SAME ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER
FILE NUMBER: 25176
INVOICE NO.: *****

Mar 29, 2010 PAGE 209

SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 8	7.00	3124.00
LITIGATION - 9		
08/31/09 REVIEW MEMO FROM G.E. SCHULMAN RE CONSOLIDATED STATUS ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.20	95.00
11/14/09 REVIEW CONSOLIDATED HEALTHCARE FINANCIAL STATEMENTS FOR P/E 12/31/2008 AND 03/31/2009 ATTORNEY: DAVID A. GILL	.30	142.50
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 9	.50	237.50
ATTORNEY FEES:	568.90 HRS	<u>211966.50</u>