

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010 PAGE 483

03/04/10 REVISE HAGUE CONVENTION REQUEST FOR INTERNATIONAL SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.90	229.50
03/04/10 CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE REQUIREMENTS BY DARLENE QUERY; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/04/10 REVIEW AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS TO BE SENT TO DARLENE QUERY ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
03/04/10 CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE DOCUMENTS TO BE FORWARDED TO DARLENE QUERY; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/04/10 REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL CONFLICT CHECK AGAINST COMPLAINT ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	NO CHARGE
03/04/10 UPDATE AND REVISE LITIGATION STATUS CHART ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/04/10 REVIEW MEMO FROM G.G. MIKALIAN RE CHANGE OF ASSIGNED JUDGE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/04/10 TEL. CONF. WITH DARLENE QUERY (SHERIFF-CIVIL ENFORCEMENT) RE SERVICE REQUIREMENTS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/04/10 REVIEW MEMO FROM ALBERTA SHERIFF-CIVIL ENFORCEMENT OFFICE RE SERVICE PROCEDURES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/04/10 CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE PROCEDURES; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 484

03/04/10	CONFERENCE WITH G.G. MIKALIAN RE SERVICE ISSUES AND INCLUSION OF ORDER RE CHANGE OF ASSIGNED JUDGE WITH SERVICE PACKET ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/04/10	REVISE REQUEST FOR SERVICE ABROAD OF JUDICIAL OR EXTRAJUDICIAL DOCUMENTS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
03/04/10	PREPARE AND REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO DARLENE QUERY (ALBERTA SHERIFF-CIVIL ENFORCEMENT OFFICE) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
03/05/10	ATTENTION TO SERVICE OF SUMMONS AND COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.60	357.00
03/05/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE OF SUMMONS AND COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.60	NO CHARGE
03/05/10	CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE INTERNATIONAL SERVICE OF PROCESS AND CORRESPONDENCE RE ACKNOWLEDGING PROCESS TO OPPOSING COUNSEL ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
03/05/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS IN CANADA ON PETROREAL ENERGY ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.70	178.50
03/08/10	REVIEW CONFIRMATION OF DELIVERY OF SUMMONS & COMPLAINT TO SHERIFF IN ALBERTA, CANADA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/08/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE CONFIRMATION OF DELIVERY OF SUMMONS & COMPLAINT TO SHERIFF IN ALBERTA, CANADA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 485

03/10/10 ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
03/16/10 CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE PROBLEMS WITH SERVICE AND OTHER ISSUES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
03/16/10 CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE PROBLEMS WITH SERVICE AND OTHER ISSUES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/16/10 TEL. CONF. WITH DARLENE QUERY RE PROBLEMS WITH SERVICE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/16/10 REVIEW MEMO FROM DARLENE QUERY RE PROBLEMS WITH SERVICE AND OTHER ISSUES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/16/10 REVIEW MEMO FROM DARLENE QUERY RE SERVICE ON PETRO REAL ENERGY INC., CALGARY; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/17/10 TEL CONF WITH E. MATTHAI RE CLAIMS AGAINST MAYER & GLASSMAN ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.40	238.00
03/18/10 ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
03/18/10 RESEARCH RE PETROREAL OF AMERICA, INC. AND CONFER WITH J.R. RAMOS RE SAME ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
03/18/10 PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE OBTAINING DOCUMENTS OF RECORD RE PETROREAL AMERICA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 486

03/18/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ISSUES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/18/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE DOCUMENTS OF RECORD RE PETROREAL AMERICA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/18/10	TEL. CONF. WITH CAL LENDERS RE OBTAINING DOCUMENTS OF RECORD RE PETROREAL AMERICA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/18/10	CONFIRM AND CALENDAR MULTIPLE DEADLINES FOR UNREPRESENTED DEFENDANTS TO RETURN SIGNED SERVICE WAIVERS AND PREPARE MEMO TO G.E. SCHULMAN RE SAME ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/18/10	REVIEW FRCP RULE 4(D) PACKAGES AND UPDATE LITIGATION STATUS CHART RE APPLICABLE DEADLINES RE SERVICE WAIVERS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/18/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM DARLENE QUERY RE SERVICE ISSUES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/22/10	TEL. CONF. WITH WILLIAM DAWSON RE LENDERS DEPOT INC. ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.50	270.00
03/24/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. DAWSON RE EXTENSION FOR LENDERS DEPOT TO RESPOND TO COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
03/29/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM DARLENE QUERY AND M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ISSUES RE PETROREAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 487

04/01/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM M.G. D'ALBA AND DARLENE QUERY RE SERVICE ISSUES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
04/06/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ALBERTA SHERIFF RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON PETRO REAL ENERGY, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
04/06/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM M.G. D'ALBA AND DARLENE QUERY RE SERVICE ISSUES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/19/10	TEL. CONF. WITH B. DAWSON RE CLAIMS AGAINST LENDERS DEPOT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
04/21/10	CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE ADDRESS SEARCH FOR PETRO REAL ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
04/21/10	CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE CORPORATE SEARCH RESULTS RE PETROREAL ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
04/21/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM M.G. D'ALBA AND DARLENE QUERY RE SERVICE ISSUES; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/21/10	RESEARCH ALTERNATE ADDRESSES FOR PETRO REAL ENERGY, INC. ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/21/10	RESEARCH CORPORATE SEARCH PROCEDURES IN ALBERTA, CANADA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
04/21/10	TEL. CONF. WITH ALBERTA TAX & REVENUE AGENCY; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010 PAGE 488

04/21/10	TEL. CONF. WITH SERVICE ALBERTA RE CORPORATE INFORMATION ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/21/10	TEL. CONF. WITH A-PLUS REGISTRY RE CORPORATE SEARCH RE PETRO REAL AND FUNCTIONS OF TRANSFER AGENTS; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.50	97.50
04/21/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE ADDRESS SEARCH FOR PETRO REAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/21/10	PREPARE MEMO TO A-PLUS REGISTRY RE PETROREAL CORPORATE SEARCH ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/21/10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A-PLUS REGISTRY RE SEARCH RESULTS RE PETROREAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/21/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE CORPORATE SEARCH RESULTS RE PETROREAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
04/22/10	DRAFT MEMO RE COMMUNICATION WITH B. DAWSON RE RESOLUTION OF CLAIMS ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
04/22/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE DISCUSSIONS WITH LENDERS DEPOT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	NO CHARGE
04/22/10	RESEARCH RE SERVICE OF PROCESS UPON CANADIAN CORPORATIONS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.70	178.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 489

04/22/10	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE DISCUSSIONS WITH LENDERS DEPOT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
04/22/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE OF PROCESS IN VANCOUVER; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/22/10	RESEARCH SERVICE OF PROCESS ISSUES AND PROCEDURES IN VANCOUVER ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.50	97.50
04/22/10	TEL. CONF. WITH BRITISH COLUMBIA COURT SERVICES BRANCH; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
04/22/10	TEL. CONF. WITH DOROTHY DARDANGO (BRITISH COLUMBIA MINISTRY OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/22/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM DOROTHY DARDANGO (BRITISH COLUMBIA MINISTRY OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL) RE SERVICE OF PROCESS FEES AND PROCEDURES; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
04/22/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE FEES FOR SERVICE OF PROCESS IN BRITISH COLUMBIA; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/23/10	RESEARCH RE DIRECTORS OF PETROREAL ENERGY ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.60	153.00
04/23/10	ATTEND TO INTERNATIONAL SERVICE OF PROCESS RE PETROREAL ENERGY ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	1.00	255.00
04/23/10	REVIEW DEADLINES RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 490

04/23/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE SUMMARY OF SEARCH RESULTS RE ADDRESSES FOR PATRICK MCGOWAN IN ALBERTA AND BRITISH COLUMBIA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/23/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE ADDRESS SEARCHES IN ALBERTA PROVINCE RE PATRICK MCGOWAN; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
04/23/10	RESEARCH ADDRESSES FOR PATRICK MCGOWAN IN ALBERTA AND BRITISH COLUMBIA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.50	97.50
04/23/10	RESEARCH SERVICE ADDRESS FOR PATRICK MCGOWAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.50	97.50
04/23/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ADDRESS FOR PATRICK MCGOWAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/23/10	PREPARE MEMO TO CAL LENDERS RE DOCUMENTS OF RECORD RE PETROREAL OF AMERICA, INC.; REVIEW RESPONSE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/23/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ISSUES RE PATRICK MCGOWAN; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/23/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE DOCUMENTS OF RECORD RE PETROREAL OF AMERICA, INC.; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/26/10	COORDINATE AND FOLLOW-UP ON SERVICE FEES RE PETROREAL (VANCOUVER) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50



DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 491

04/27/10	RESEARCH HAGUE CONVENTION RE INTERNATIONAL SERVICE AND WHETHER SWITZERLAND IS A PARTY (FOR SERVICE PURPOSES RE PETROREAL) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
04/30/10	RESEARCH RE BOARD OF DIRECTORS FOR PETROREAL ENERGY, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.90	229.50
04/30/10	CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE SERVICE ISSUES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
04/30/10	RESEARCH RE PRIVATE INVESTIGATORS TO LOCATE PATRICK MCGOWAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/30/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ISSUES IN SWITZERLAND AND INVESTIGATION RE SAME ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/30/10	RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO SERVICE OF PROCESS IN SWITZERLAND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.70	136.50
04/30/10	PREPARE MEMO TO OFFICE FEDERAL DE LA JUSTICE RE SERVICE OF PROCESS IN SWITZERLAND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH J.R. RAMOS RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ISSUES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
05/03/10	CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE SERVICE OF PROCESS IN SWITZERLAND ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
05/03/10	CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE INVESTIGATION OF MR. MCGOWAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 492

05/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH J.R. RAMOS RE ADDITIONAL RESEARCH RE PATRICK MCGOWAN AND LIV THERAPUTICS, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
05/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE ADDITIONAL RESEARCH RE PATRICK MCGOWAN AND MIV THERAPEUTICS, INC. ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH GEORGE FRANCO (PRIVATE INVESTIGATOR) RE LOCATING PATRICK MCGOWAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/03/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ADDRESS FOR PATRICK MCGOWAN AT MIV THERAPEUTICS, INC. ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
05/03/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SUBSTANCE OF CONVERSATION WITH APS INTERNATIONAL RE INTERNATIONAL SERVICE OF PROCESS PROCEDURES AND COST ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
05/03/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE FURTHER INVESTIGATION RE PATRICK MCGOWAN; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
05/03/10	RESEARCH BACKGROUND INFORMATION RE PATRICK MCGOWAN (PETRO REAL DIRECTOR) AND MIV THERAPEUTICS, INC., INCLUDING SEC FILINGS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.70	136.50
05/03/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE GUIDELINES OF THE SWISS FEDERAL OFFICE OF JUSTICE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 493

05/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH PRO-LEGAL RE INTERNATIONAL SERVICE OF PROCESS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/03/10	TEL. CONF. WITH APS INTERNATIONAL RE INTERNATIONAL SERVICE OF PROCESS PROCEDURES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/03/10	RESEARCH AND REVIEW GUIDELINES OF THE SWISS FEDERAL OFFICE OF JUSTICE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
05/03/10	RESEARCH INFORMATION RE SPECIFIC SWISS CANTONAL AUTHORITIES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/03/10	RESEARCH HAGUE SERVICE CONVENTION RE WHETHER DGDK IS A COMPETENT AUTHORITY OR JUDICIAL OFFICER FOR INTERNATIONAL SERVICE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/03/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM SWITZERLAND FEDERAL DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE AND POLICE RE INTERNATIONAL SERVICE OF PROCESS; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/04/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MS. DARDENGO RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON PETROREAL ENERGY, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.90	229.50
05/04/10	TEL. CONF. WITH J.R. RAMOS RE CONFIRMATION OF PATRICK MCGOWAN'S ADDRESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
05/04/10	TEL. CONF. WITH J.R. RAMOS RE RESEARCH RE PRIVATE INVESTIGATORS FOR LOCATING PATRICK MCGOWAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 494

05/04/10	RESEARCH AND INTERVIEW PRIVATE INVESTIGATORS FOR LOCATING PATRICK MCGOWAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.70	136.50
05/04/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM ROD GEHL (PRIVATE INVESTIGATOR) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/04/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MIV THERAPEUTICS TO CONFIRM ADDRESS OF PATRICK MCGOWAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/04/10	TEL. CONF. WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE CONFIRMATION OF PATRICK MCGOWAN'S ADDRESS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/04/10	TEL. CONF. WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE RESEARCH RE PRIVATE INVESTIGATORS FOR LOCATING PATRICK MCGOWAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/05/10	REVIEW SERVICE OF PROCESS IN VANCOUVER, BRITISH COLUMBIA ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
05/06/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ISSUES RE PATRICK MCGOWAN; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
05/07/10	PREPARE MEMO TO DORIS DARDANGO (BRITISH COLUMBIA CENTRAL AUTHORITY ADMINISTRATOR) RE SERVICE ISSUES RE PETROREAL VIA PATRICK MCGOWAN; REVIEW RESPONSE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/07/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE ISSUES RE PETROREAL VIA PATRICK MCGOWAN; MULTIPLE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 495

05/10/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM DARLENE QUERY RE SERVICE ON PETROREAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
05/13/10	REVIEW MEMOS FROM M.G. D'ALBA AND DARLENE QUERY RE CERTIFICATE RE FAILURE OF SERVICE ON PETROREAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/27/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	1.00	255.00
05/27/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.80	204.00
05/27/10	PREPARE MEMOS TO CAL LENDERS TO FOLLOW UP ON ORDER FOR DOCUMENTS OF RECORD FOR PETROREAL OF AMERICA, INC.; REVIEW AND REPLY TO RESPONSES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
05/27/10	REVIEW DOCUMENTS OF RECORD FOR PETROREAL OF AMERICA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/27/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE DOCUMENTS OF RECORD FOR PETROREAL OF AMERICA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/27/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM CAL LENDERS RE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS OF RECORD; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/27/10	REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS OF RECORD FOR PETROREAL OF AMERICA AND COMPARE WITH EARLIER TRANSMITTAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 496

05/27/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS OF RECORD FOR PETROREAL OF AMERICA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
05/28/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
06/02/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
06/04/10	REVIEW CERTIFIED DOCUMENTS OF RECORD RE PETROREAL OF AMERICA ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
06/04/10	PREPARE MEMOS TO CAL LENDERS RE CERTIFIED DOCUMENTS OF RECORD RE PETROREAL OF AMERICA; REVIEW AND REPLY TO RESPONSES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
06/11/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MS. DARDENGO RE ALTERNATE LOCATIONS OF MR. ROELKE ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/18/10	PREPARATION OF ALL EXHIBITS FOR COUNSEL. ATTORNEY: GILBERT G. MIKALIAN	1.20	288.00
06/24/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE CLAIM AGAINST YOUR PLATINUM DISTRIBUTORS ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.50	NO CHARGE
06/24/10	CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE CLAIM AGAINST YOUR PLATINUM DISTRIBUTORS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
06/24/10	REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. MCGOWAN RE CLAIM AGAINST PETROREAL ENERGY ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 497

06/24/10	RESEARCH AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO MR. MCGOWAN RE STATUS AS DIRECTOR OF PETROREAL ENERGY, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.70	178.50
06/24/10	DRAFT REPORT RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.70	178.50
06/24/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MS. DARDENGO RE SERVICE OF PROCESS IN BRITISH COLUMBIA ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
06/24/10	REVIEW SERVICE OF PROCESS ON PETROREAL, INC. RE RESPONSE TO MR. MCGOWAN'S CORRESPONDENCE AND REPORT TO COURT RE STATUS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/28/10	REVIEW SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
06/30/10	REVIEW PROOF OF SERVICE RE PETROREAL OF LOUISIANA, LLC ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
07/01/10	REVIEW PROOF OF SERVICE RE PETROREAL OF AMERICA, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
07/19/10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR. VON KURSELL RE STATUS AS DIRECTOR OF PETROREAL OF AMERICA ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
07/23/10	REVIEW PROOFS OF SERVICE ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
07/23/10	REVIEW SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 498

07/26/10	TEL. CONF. WITH E. MATTHAI RE MAYER & GLASSMAN TOLLING AGREEMENT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
07/27/10	REVIEW STATUS OF SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
07/27/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MR. WHITE RE CLAIM AGAINST PETROREAL OF LOUISIANA, LLC ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
07/27/10	REVIEW SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
07/27/10	REVIEW STATUS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
07/29/10	CONFER WITH M. G. D'ALBA AND G. G. MIKALIAN RE STATUS ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.10	NO CHARGE
08/02/10	DRAFT REQUESTS FOR ENTRY OF DEFAULT DRAFT REQUEST TO ENTER DEFAULT AGAINST PETROREAL ENERGY ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.90	229.50
08/18/10	REVIEW PROOFS OF SERVICE FOR MR. SILVERSTEIN AND MR. DAWSON ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
08/23/10	REVISE DECLARATION RE DEFAULT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
08/27/10	DRAFT DECLARATIONS RE ENTRY OF DEFAULT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
08/27/10	DRAFT DECLARATIONS RE ENTRY OF DEFAULT FOR ALL DEFENDANTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	1.00	255.00



DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 499

08/27/10	REVISE DECLARATIONS RE DEFAULT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
08/29/10	DRAFT REQUEST TO ENTER DEFAULT AGAINST PETROREAL ENERGY, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
08/29/10	DRAFT DECLARATION OF G.E. SCHULMAN IN SUPPORT OF REQUEST TO ENTER DEFAULT AGAINST LENDERS DEPOT, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
08/31/10	REVISE REQUEST TO ENTER DEFAULT AGAINST PETROREAL ENERGY, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
08/31/10	REVISE REQUEST TO ENTER DEFAULT AGAINST PETROREAL ENERGY, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
SUBTOTAL FOR LITIGATION - 72		61.90	15008.00
LITIGATION - 73			
03/01/10	REVIEW AND MAKE FINAL EDITS TO FAMILY COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.80	432.00
03/01/10	REVIEW AND SEND MEMOS RE GARY FRIEDMAN TRANSFERS IN FAMILY COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
03/01/10	REVIEW AND SEND MEMOS RE M. KAPLAN, TOLLING AGREEMENT, REVISION OF FAMILY COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
03/01/10	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LATEST DRAFT OF FAMILY COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	1.40	833.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 500

03/01/10	FINAL DRAFTING AND PREPARATION FOR FILING OF THE FAMILY COMPLAINT. ATTORNEY: GILBERT G. MIKALIAN	.50	120.00
03/01/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE DEFENDANTS' NAMES AND ADDRESSES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/01/10	REVISE LITIGATION STATUS CHART ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/02/10	FINAL REVIEW OF FAMILY COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.50	270.00
03/02/10	FINAL REVIEW OF FAMILY COMPLAINT AND RELATED PAPERS FOR FILING ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.90	535.50
03/02/10	CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
03/02/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE COMPLAINT ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/03/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. PHILLIPS RE REPRESENTATION OF DEFENDANTS ON FAMILY COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
03/04/10	REVIEW FILED PAPERS AND ATTENTION TO SERVICE ISSUES ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.30	178.50
03/05/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE OF PROCESS AND AMENDING COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.60	NO CHARGE
03/05/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 501

03/05/10	REVISE LETTER TO MR. PHILLIPS RE REPRESENTATION OF MR. FRIEDMAN'S FAMILY MEMBERS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
03/05/10	REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO UNREPRESENTED INVESTOR DEFENDANTS RE ACKNOWLEDGING SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
03/05/10	CONFERENCE WITH G.E. SCHULMAN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS AND AMENDING COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.60	153.00
03/05/10	REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEYS AND UNREPRESENTED PARTIES RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
03/08/10	REVISE LETTER TO MR. PHILLIPS RE REPRESENTATION OF DEFENDANTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
03/08/10	UPDATE AND REVISE LITIGATION STATUS CHART ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/09/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
03/11/10	CALL TO AND TRANSMITTAL OF SUMMONS, COMPLAINT, ACKNOWLEDGMENT OR RECEIPT AND ALL RELATED DOCUMENTS TO POSSIBLE COUNSEL FOR SHAWNA FRIEDMAN. ATTORNEY: GILBERT G. MIKALIAN	.80	192.00
03/11/10	DRAFT NOTICE AND ACKNOWLEDGMENT FOR SHAWNA FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
03/12/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MR. FRIEDMAN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 502

03/12/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS; REVIEW RESPONSE ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/12/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE LETTERS TO UNREPRESENTED PARTIES AND RELATED DOCUMENTS; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/12/10	PREPARE AND REVISE LETTER TO UNREPRESENTED PARTY (GARY FRIEDMAN) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
03/12/10	PREPARE AND REVISE LETTER TO UNREPRESENTED PARTY (WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/12/10	PREPARE NOTICE OF LAWSUIT AND REQUEST FOR WAIVER OF SERVICE (GARY FRIEDMAN) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/12/10	PREPARE NOTICE OF LAWSUIT AND REQUEST FOR WAIVER OF SERVICE (WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/12/10	PREPARE WAIVER OF SERVICE (GARY FRIEDMAN) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/12/10	PREPARE WAIVER OF SERVICE (WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/12/10	PREPARE ATTACHMENT "A" TO NOTICE OF LAWSUIT AND REQUEST FOR WAIVER OF SERVICE (LIST OF DOCUMENTS TO BE SERVED) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 503

03/12/10	PREPARE ATTACHMENT "B" TO NOTICE OF LAWSUIT AND REQUEST FOR WAIVER OF SERVICE (STATEMENT RE DUTY TO AVOID UNNECESSARY EXPENSES) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/12/10	REVISE LITIGATION STATUS CHART ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/15/10	ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS AND SUBFILE PER DEFENDANT, SEND MEMO RE SAME ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.40	216.00
03/15/10	REVIEW LETTER AND ACKNOWLEDGMENT TO G. FRIEDMAN: REVIEW E-MAIL TO G. FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.20	119.00
03/15/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
03/15/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	1.40	357.00
03/16/10	REVIEW TRANSFER ORDER TO JUDGE REAL ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.10	NO CHARGE
03/16/10	REVIEW AND REVISE AMENDED NOTICE OF RELATED CASE ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.20	119.00
03/16/10	REVISE AMENDED NOTICE OF RELATED CASE ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
03/16/10	REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO UNREPRESENTED PARTIES RE WAIVER OF SERVICE OF SUMMONS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
03/16/10	DRAFT SECOND NOTICE OF RELATED CASE ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.70	178.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 504

03/16/10	REVISE SECOND NOTICE OF RELATED CASE ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
03/17/10	DRAFT MEMO TO R. MICHELMAN RE OTHER DEFENDANTS WHO HE MIGHT REPRESENT ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.20	119.00
03/17/10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR. PHILLIPS AND DRAFT RESPONSE ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
03/17/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
03/18/10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. PHILLIPS RE RELATIONSHIP OF W. MEHLMAN, RESPOND ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
03/18/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
03/18/10	REVIEW AND REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. PHILLIPS RE NOTICES OF ACKNOWLEDGMENT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
03/25/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
03/25/10	DRAFT MEMO TO J.R. RAMOS RE SERVICE OF PROCESS AND CONFERENCES RE SAME ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
03/25/10	REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO UNREPRESENTED DEFENDANTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
03/25/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE RULE 4(D) LETTERS; RESPOND AND REVIEW REPLIES ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 505

03/25/10 PREPARE LETTER TO UNREPRESENTED PARTY (DARYN FRIEDMAN) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
03/25/10 PREPARE LETTER TO UNREPRESENTED PARTY (KARRY FRIEDMAN AKA KARRY LIKER) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10 PREPARE NOTICE OF LAWSUIT AND REQUEST FOR WAIVER OF SERVICE (KARRY FRIEDMAN AKA KARRY LIKER) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10 PREPARE NOTICE OF LAWSUIT AND REQUEST FOR WAIVER OF SERVICE (DARYN FRIEDMAN) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/25/10 PREPARE WAIVER OF SERVICE (DARYN FRIEDMAN) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10 PREPARE WAIVER OF SERVICE (KARRY FRIEDMAN AKA KARRY LIKER) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/25/10 REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE KARRY FRIEDMAN AKA KARRY LIKER ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/25/10 CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10 REVIEW RULE 4(D) AND RULE 4(E) (1) PACKAGES, CALCULATE APPLICABLE DEADLINES AND REVISE AND UPDATE LITIGATION STATUS CHART ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.50	97.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 506

03/25/10	CONFIRM AND CALENDAR DEADLINES RE SERVICE WAIVERS AND ACKNOWLEDGMENTS OF SERVICE AND PREPARE MEMO TO G.E. SCHULMAN RE SAME ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10	PREPARE NEW WAIVERS OF SERVICE RE GARY FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SHAWNA FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10	TEL. CONF. WITH RACHEL LAYBOURN RE DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM RACHEL LAYBOURN RE SEARCHES RE DOROTHY FRIEDMAN; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
03/25/10	PREPARE WAIVER OF SERVICE (KARRY FRIEDMAN AKA KARRY LIKER) ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
03/31/10	DRAFT AMENDED NOTICES OF ACKNOWLEDGMENT AND CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. PHILLIPS RE NOTICES OF ACKNOWLEDGMENT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.80	204.00
04/05/10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. PHILLIPS RE: MEHLMAN DEFENDANTS IN FAMILY CASE ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.20	119.00



DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010 PAGE 507

04/13/10	TEL CONF WITH R. MICHELMAN RE CLAIM AGAINST S. FRIEDMAN FOR CAR: REVIEW E-MAIL AND DOCUMENTATION RE CAR; DRAFT MEMO TO R. MICHELMAN; DRAFT MEMO TO G. G. MIKALIAN RE S. FRIEDMAN CAR; DRAFT MEMO TO M. G. D'ALBA RE WAIVERS FOR S. FRIEDMAN AND FOR D. FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.60	357.00
04/13/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. MICHELMAN RE SHAWNA ARIELLE FRIEDMAN AND DARYN I. FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.80	204.00
04/22/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M. G. D'ALBA RE K. LIKER; DRAFT MEMO RE SENDING PACKAGE TO ATTORNEY R. MICHELMAN ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.10	59.50
04/22/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM R. MICHELMAN RE SETTLEMENT; DRAFT EXTENSIVE REPLY ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.60	357.00
04/22/10	REVIEW STATUS OF SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.70	178.50
04/22/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MR. MICHELMAN RE KARRY FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
04/22/10	RESEARCH RE DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
04/22/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. MICHELMAN RE KARRY FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
04/22/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 508

04/22/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE KARRY LIKER ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
04/22/10	RESEARCH ADDRESSES FOR KARRY LIKER OR KARRY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/22/10	RESEARCH ADDRESSES FOR DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
04/22/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE SEARCH FOR BRUCE FRIEDMAN'S HISTORY OF ADDRESSES IN CONNECTION WITH SEARCH FOR DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.10	19.50
04/22/10	RESEARCH ADDRESS HISTORY FOR BRUCE FRIEDMAN IN CONNECTION WITH SEARCH FOR DOROTHY FRIEDMAN ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
04/22/10	RESEARCH TELEPHONE NUMBERS FOR DOROTHY FRIEDMAN BASED ON WESTLAW SEARCH RESULTS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.40	78.00
04/23/10	TEL. CONF. WITH ASSISTANT TO GARY FRIEDMAN RE MR. FRIEMDAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
04/26/10	REVIEW S. MEHLMAN ANSWER AND RELATED PAPERS: DRAFT MEMO RE SAME ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.50	297.50
04/26/10	REVIEW SITOMER ANSWER TO COMPLAINT AND RELATED PAPERS; DRAFT MEMO RE SAME ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.50	297.50
04/26/10	REVIEW ANSWER AND RELATED PAPERS BY W. MEHLMAN; DRAFT MEMO RE SAME ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.50	297.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 509

04/26/10	TEL. CONF. WITH GARY FRIEDMAN RE COUNSEL ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
04/27/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM M.G. D'ALBA RE DOROTHY FRIEDMAN'S ADDRESS; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/27/10	REVIEW PROOF OF CLAIM TO VERIFY DARYN FRIEDMAN'S ADDRESS AND REVISE LITIGATION STATUS CHART RE SAME ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/27/10	PREPARE MEMO TO M.G. D'ALBA RE CONFIRMATION OF DARYN FRIEDMAN'S AND KARRY LIKER'S ADDRESS ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
04/30/10	REVIEW ANSWERS FILED BY KELLY MEHLMAN, WENDY ANN MEHLMAN, JULIE AND ROBERT SITOMER, AND STEPHANIE MEHLMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
05/06/10	REVIEW MEMOS RE REPRESENTATION OF GARY FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
05/10/10	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MEMO RE NEW REPRESENTATION FOR FAMILY MEMBERS ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
05/10/10	REVIEW MEMO FROM K.B. PHELPS RE NEW COUNSEL FOR KARRY LIKER AND DARYN FRIEDMAN; RESPOND ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.20	39.00
05/10/10	REVISE LITIGATION STATUS CHART ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50
05/11/10	UPDATE LITIGATION STATUS CHART ASSISTANT: JESSICA R RAMOS	.30	58.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 510

FILE NUMBER: 25176A

INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

05/12/10	CONFERENCE WITH G.G. MIKALIAN RE EARLY MEETING RE MEHLMANS ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
05/12/10	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE EARLY MEETING RE MEHLMANS ATTORNEY: GILBERT G. MIKALIAN	.10	24.00
05/13/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE EARLY MEETING REPORT ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	NO CHARGE
05/13/10	DRAFT JOINT REPORT OF EARLY MEETING ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	1.70	433.50
05/13/10	CONFERENCE WITH K.B. PHELPS RE EARLY MEETING REPORT ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
05/18/10	REVIEW RULE 26(F) MEETING REQUIREMENTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
05/24/10	TEL. CONF. WITH J. PHILLIPS RE RESOLUTION WITH FAMILY MEMBERS ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
05/27/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MR. GREEN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON MR. FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
05/27/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
05/28/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. GREEN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON MR. FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 511

05/28/10	DRAFT LETTER TO MR. GREEN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON MR. FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.60	153.00
05/28/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. GREEN RE MR. FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
06/01/10	CONFERENCE WITH J.R. RAMOS RE DEFENDANTS' NAMES AND ADDRESSES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/02/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.90	229.50
06/04/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. MICHELMAN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
06/07/10	DRAFT STIPULATION AND ORDER EXTENDING TIME FOR SUBMISSION OF INITIAL DISCLOSURES UNDER RULE 26 (A) ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
06/16/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
06/16/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. MICHELMAN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/16/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MR. MICHELMAN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON MS. FRIEDMAN AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. MICHELMAN TRANSMITTING SERVICE OF PROCESS WAIVER MATERIALS TO MS. FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	1.00	255.00

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 512

06/21/10	REVIEW AND REVISE INITIAL DISCLOSURES IN FAMILY COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.20	119.00
06/21/10	REVISE RULE 26(A) INITIAL DISCLOSURES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
06/21/10	DRAFT INITIAL DISCLOSURES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/21/10	DRAFT RULE 26(A) INITIAL DISCLOSURES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
06/21/10	DRAFT RULE 26(A) INITIAL DISCLOSURE ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/21/10	DRAFT RULE 26(A) INITIAL DISCLOSURES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.50	127.50
06/21/10	DRAFT INITIAL DISCLOSURES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
06/21/10	TEL. CONF. WITH MR. GREEN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON MR. FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/21/10	DRAFT RULE 26(A) INITIAL DISCLOSURES ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
06/24/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MS. BONILLA RE SERVICE WAIVER FOR MS. FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
06/28/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.40	102.00
06/29/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. GREEN RE SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE RE GARY FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50

DAVID A. GILL, RECEIVER  
FILE NUMBER: 25176A  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Oct 27, 2010

PAGE 513

06/30/10	DRAFT MEMO SUMMARIZING CLAIMS AGAINST GARY FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.30	76.50
07/01/10	CONFERENCE WITH M.G. D'ALBA RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON MR. FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS, INC. ATTORNEY: GILBERT G. MIKALIAN	.20	48.00
07/01/10	CONFERENCE WITH G.G. MIKALIAN RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ON MR. FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	NO CHARGE
07/06/10	DRAFT MEMO RE: REPRESENTATION OF G. FRIEDMAN BY M. LIEBERMAN ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.20	119.00
07/07/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. LIEBERMAN RE MR. FRIEDMAN ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
07/07/10	ATTEND TO SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
07/09/10	CONFERENCE WITH MS. KELLY RE SERVICE OF PROCESS ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.10	25.50
07/09/10	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. LIEBERMAN RE CLAIMS AGAINST GARY FRIEDMAN AND WORLDWIDE FINANCIAL INVESTMENTS, INC. ATTORNEY: MICHAEL G. D'ALBA	.20	51.00
07/22/10	TEL. CONF. WITH M LIEBERMAN RE ONE DAY EXTENSION FOR GARY FRIEDMAN ANSWER ATTORNEY: KATHY BAZOIAN PHELPS	.10	54.00
07/23/10	REVIEW GARY FRIEDMAN ANSWER TO COMPLAINT ATTORNEY: GEORGE E. SCHULMAN	.30	178.50

